
Opened December 3, 2014

Preliminary does not constitute an award BID 14-176 /PVC Pipe 

Buyer: David W. Collier
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1 1398406       5,600 6" 3.34$      3.57$     $19,992.00 $3.62 $20,272.00 $3.65 $20,440.00 $3.69 $20,664.00 $3.70 $20,720.00 $3.71 $20,776.00 $3.73 $20,888.00 $3.84 $21,504.00

2 1398408     19,200 8" 5.69$      6.20$     $119,040.00 $6.26 $120,192.00 $6.33 $121,536.00 $6.41 $123,072.00 $6.41 $123,072.00 $6.43 $123,456.00 $6.45 $123,840.00 $6.65 $127,680.00

3 1398412     15,120 12" $13.05 13.11$   $198,223.20 $13.25 $200,340.00 $13.35 $201,852.00 $13.49 $203,968.80 $13.55 $204,876.00 $13.62 $205,934.40 $13.66 $206,539.20 $14.08 $212,889.60
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1 1398404
4,320

4"  $      1.80  $     2.08 $8,985.60  $   2.22 $9,590.40  $   2.08 $8,985.60  $   1.88 $8,121.60  $   2.21 $9,547.20 $2.44 $10,540.80 $2.78 $12,009.60
no bid no bid

2 1398406
      5,600 

6" 3.34$       $     4.12 $23,072.00 $4.41 $24,696.00 $4.12 $23,072.00 $3.77 $21,112.00 $4.40 $24,640.00 $4.43 $24,808.00 $5.60 $31,360.00
no bid no bid

3 1398408       3,200 8" 5.69$      7.15$     $22,880.00 $7.63 $24,416.00 $7.15 $22,880.00 $6.52 $20,864.00 $7.61 $24,352.00 $7.68 $24,576.00 $9.67 $30,944.00
no bid no bid

4 1398412       1,680 12" 13.05$   15.15$   $25,452.00 $16.16 $27,148.80 $15.15 $25,452.00 $13.83 $23,234.40 $16.12 $27,081.60 $16.12 $27,081.60 $20.49 $34,423.20 no bid no bid

Delivery

 

Category #2 2015 Additional Quantities & Job 

Site Delivery

National

$85,620.80

Apparent Best Bid: Ferguson Waterworks and Consolidated Pipe

Total Price

Schedule

$337,255.20

$80,389.60

NationalRoyal

Hayes Pipe Supply

Vinyl Plex Vulcan

C.I. Thornburg
Cosolidated Pipe 

Supply

$85,851.20

Royal

Schedule

HD Supply

Schedule

Ferguson Waterworks

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Delivery

$73,332.00

$343,828.00$340,804.00

Schedule Schedule

Category #1 Purchase & Deliver                  Project 

Estimate: $335,000.00

Royal

Total Price $347,704.80 $348,668.00

Planholders not submitting:Bid Ocean, Cardinal Sales, Lewis Municipal Sales, Onvia, Thompson Dist. (MBE) 

Planholders submitting "No Bid": None

$80,389.60

Award Bid signed:     yes

Total Price

Royal VulcanVinyl Plex

EJ Prescott Plumbers

$350,166.40 $351,267.20

National Sanderson

National Sanderson

Fortiline

Sanderson

Schedule

$362,073.60

Sanderson

$87,006.40 $108,736.80

Schedule Schedule

$0.00

7 days 7-14 days 15 days 0-60 Days 15 days 30 days 21 days

Contract Period: Spot purchase Delivery 31-Dec-2015


